
AGENDA REQUEST DEADLINE:  All agenda requests and supporting materials must be submitted as a 
pdf to agenda@co.travis.tx.us by Tuesdays at 5:00 p.m. for the next week's meeting. 
 

 
 
Meeting Date: November 7, 2014 
Prepared By/Phone Number: David Walch 46663; Marvin Brice 49765 
Elected/Appointed Official/Dept. Head: Cyd Grimes 
Commissioners Court Sponsor: Judge Biscoe 

Agenda Language:  Approve Modification No. 1 to Contract No. 
4400000576, SCI Texas Funeral Services Inc., d/b/a Cook Walden 
Funeral Home for Indigent Burial Services. 
 

 Purchasing Recommendation and Comments:  Purchasing concurs 
with department and recommends approval of requested action. This 
procurement action meets the compliance requirements as outlined by 
the statutes. 

The contractor provides Indigent Burial Services for Travis County.  This 
Modification No. 1 is an assignment of the contract from New Forest 
Oaks INc d/b/a Cook Walden Forest Oaks, Tax ID No. 76-0291087 to 
SCI Texas Funeral Services, Inc., Tax ID No. 75-1007318.  The 
contractor restructured and the legal entity changed.  Services are 
ongoing and have not been impacted by this change. 

 

 Contract Expenditures: Within the last 12 months $9,625.00 has been 
spent against this contract/requirement. 

 
 

 Contract-Related Information: 

Award Amount:  As-Needed Agreement   
Contract Type:  Professional Services Agreement 
Contract Period:  April 25, 1995 – Until Terminated 

 Contract Modification Information: 

Modification Amount:   N/A As-Needed Agreement 
Modification Type:    Bilateral 
Modification Period:  November 7, 2014 – Until Terminated 
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 Funding Information: 

  SAP Shopping Cart #: 
  Funding Account(s):  
  Comments:  Funding not impacted by modification. 
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Juan Gonzalez

From: Duke, Donna <Donna.Duke@dignitymemorial.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 09, 2014 12:07 PM

To: David Walch

Subject: RE: Cook Walden

Attachments: scan0001.pdf

Oh great, here is the correct information. Yes, the Cook Walden Forest Oaks location does not do indigent burials 
anymore since ya’ll moved it to Manor. Please let me know if you need anything else from us!

Donna Duke-Weiss
Office Manager
Cook-Walden Funeral Home
6100 N. Lamar Blvd.
Austin, TX 78752
512-454-5611 – Office
512-451-3041-Fax
donna.duke@dignitymemorial.com
www.cookwaldenfuneralhome.com

From: David Walch [mailto:David.Walch@traviscountytx.gov]
Sent: Thursday, October 09, 2014 11:03 AM
To: Duke, Donna
Subject: RE: Cook Walden

Ms. Duke

I’m sorry it’s taken some time to clear this up. I’ve been out a few days and wasn’t able to return your call.  Today I 
have a pretty full schedule but will try to reach you later this afternoon.

Our Indigent Burial contracts are very old and are in need of updating. The vendor number and name of your business 
on our contract could very well be 20 years out of date and was only discovered recently as we’ve updated our internal 
accounting program.  

With the document I sent for signature we are attempting to update the contract to match the information we received 
on the W-9 I’ve attached. The incorrect address is most likely something I did after speaking with a representative at 
your William Cannon location.
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If I need to modify the contract to have the N. Lamar address and I have the name incorrect I’ll need a new W-9 that 
provides me with the correct information to complete the contract modification.

We’ll get it worked out.
Thanks
David

From: Duke, Donna [mailto:Donna.Duke@dignitymemorial.com] 
Sent: Sunday, October 05, 2014 10:29 AM
To: David Walch
Subject: Cook Walden

I have been trying to resolve our problem for several months, I’m not sure why you all think we just changed names, we 
have been a part of SCI for 20 years. Be that as it may I did receive some paperwork I guess we are supposed to sign but 
you have put Cook Walden Forest Oaks on all the paperwork and it should just read Cook Walden Funeral Home, also it 
says 6400 N Lamar and our address is 6100 N Lamar Blvd. Our Forest Oaks location does not participate in the indigent 
burial program anymore.

I left you a message last week but did not get a return call. Can you please get with me and let me know what to 
do? We have several contracts well over 60 days that need to be paid.

Thank you,

Donna Duke-Weiss
Office Manager
Cook-Walden Funeral Home
6100 N. Lamar Blvd.
Austin, TX 78752
512-454-5611 – Office
512-451-3041-Fax
donna.duke@dignitymemorial.com
www.cookwaldenfuneralhome.com
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Juan Gonzalez

From: Stephen New

Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 3:31 PM

To: Jennifer Proctor romero

Cc: Doantrang Lam; Marsha Watson; David Walch

Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Jennifer,

Can you please provide David the new W-9 that was sent for Cook Walden Funeral Home? He needs this to modify 
contract PS000163MQ / 44-0576. We are not able to process invoices to this vendor until this is complete. Thanks. 

From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 10:38 AM
To: David Walch
Cc: Doantrang Lam; Stephen New
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Below is an email I received form Jennifer Romero regarding the tax information.

From: Jennifer Proctor romero 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 9:57 AM
To: Marsha Watson
Subject: RE: Vendor 1000000340

I just called to verify their tax id and it did change. So V# 1000001934 is what should be used. I told Shannon in 
purchasing as well. A mod will need to be done to the contract and PO’s to the old vendor # will need to be unreceived 
so that they can be liquidated by purchasing.

Jennifer Romero
Travis County Associate Auditor II
Ph 512-854-8822
Fax 512-854-4402

From: David Walch 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 10:24 AM
To: Marsha Watson
Cc: Doantrang Lam; Stephen New
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

I’m just trying to put together the pieces. All I have is this e-mail chain too. I need something to work with to make 
things happen. IF you have the new W-9 they submitted that would help.

I haven’t found the file yet but will see what I can do.
David

From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 10:22 AM
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To: David Walch
Cc: Doantrang Lam; Stephen New
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

David,

I don’t have anything except this string of emails. Got an error message (7/31) when receiving goods for PO 
41000047306. Contacted Shannon who contacted Rose Garcia who explained the vendor was blocked by the 
auditors. My understanding, the vendor’s (Cook Walden Funeral Home) tax ID number changed. This change created a 
new vendor number.

Shannon cancelled PO 4100047306 and stated she would have to do a modification to contract to change vendor 
number before a new PO could be processed.

I’ve been waiting for notification the modification was complete.

Thanks
Marsha

From: David Walch 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 9:39 AM
To: Marsha Watson
Cc: Doantrang Lam; Stephen New
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Marsha

It looks like PO*47306 was liquidated in July.
I don’t see where the contract PS000163MQ / 44-0576 was modified to change the vendor.

Do you have a copy of the Dept memo you sent over? I’ll need a copy to make the modification to this contract to 
change the vendor.

Thanks
David

From: Rose Garcia 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 7:43 AM
To: Marsha Watson
Cc: Doantrang Lam; Stephen New; David Walch
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306
Importance: High

Shannon no longer works here… I think David Walch is doing her stuff .. I am cc him on this email

Rose 

From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 7:24 AM
To: Rose Garcia; Shannon Pleasant
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Cc: Doantrang Lam; Stephen New
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Rose,

Didn’t received a response from Shannon yesterday regarding a contract modification. Not sure if she is out or working 
another project, can you provide an update?

Thank you,
Marsha 

From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Wednesday, September 10, 2014 9:12 AM
To: Shannon Pleasant
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Has modification been completed?

From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 10:26 AM
To: Shannon Pleasant
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Thank you. Please let me know when modification is complete so that I can create another PO with new vendor 
number.

From: Shannon Pleasant 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 10:19 AM
To: Marsha Watson
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Yes, I will cancel the PO and I have to do a modification to the contract to change the vendor #

From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 10:18 AM
To: Shannon Pleasant
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

I’ll need PO 4100047306 cancelled. Can you do that?

From: Shannon Pleasant 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 9:46 AM
To: Marsha Watson
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Marsha,

I’ve contacted Jennifer at the AO and I’ll let you know what she says.
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From: Rose Garcia 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 9:31 AM
To: Marsha Watson; Shannon Pleasant
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Marsha, Shannon is the one who needs to contact the auditors…

Rose 

Rosalinda Garcia
Travis County Purchasing
512-854-9763
rose.garcia@co.travis.tx.us

From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 9:10 AM
To: Rose Garcia; Shannon Pleasant
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Thank you. I’ll contact the auditors office.

From: Rose Garcia 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 8:40 AM
To: Shannon Pleasant
Cc: Marsha Watson
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Shannon this vendor is blocked, you need to get with auditors to see why 
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Rosalinda Garcia
Travis County Purchasing
512-854-9763
rose.garcia@co.travis.tx.us

From: Shannon Pleasant 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 8:37 AM
To: Rose Garcia
Cc: Marsha Watson
Subject: RE: PO 4100047306

Rose can you assist Marsha with this SAP error.

Shannon Pleasant, CTPM
Purchasing Agent Assistant III
Travis County Purchasing
PO Box 1748, Austin TX 78767
Phone 512.854.1181
Fax  512.854.9185
shannon.pleasant@co.travis.tx.us
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From: Marsha Watson 
Sent: Thursday, July 31, 2014 7:59 AM
To: Shannon Pleasant
Subject: PO 4100047306

Shannon,

I have an automatic PO (#4100047306) that has been approved but I cannot receive. Getting message Purchase Order 
4100047306 Does Not Exist.

Please assist.

Thank you,

Marsha Watson
Travis County - HHS
502 E Highland Mall Blvd
Austin, TX 78752
512-854-5299
marsha.watson@co.travis.tx.us

This email may contain Travis County confidential information and is intended only for use by those to whom it is addressed. If you 
are not the intended recipient, please contact sender and delete all copies of the message. Thank You
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