ltem 11

7Ny Travis County Commissioners Court Agenda Request

Meeting Date: June 3", 2014

Prepared By/Phone Number: Rachel Fishback, 512.854.9853
Elected/Appointed Official/Dept. Head: Cyd Grimes
Commissioners Court Sponsor: Judge Biscoe

Agenda Language: Approve Contract Award for Asphaltic Road
Materials, IFB No. 1404-004-RF, to low bidder, Industrial Asphalt, LLC.

» Purchasing Recommendation and Comments: Purchasing concurs
with department and recommends approval of requested action. This
procurement action meets the compliance requirements as outlined by
the statutes.

This contract requires for the vendor to provide Asphaltic Road Materials
to the Travis County Transportation and Natural Resources Department.

On April 11", 2014, IFB No. 1404-004-RF was issued through BidSync.
Two (2) bids were received on May 5", 2014. The contract will include
all line items except Group A: Material Only Type CC, lines 01-05 and
01-06, and all associated Group B: Hauling Charges that require the
vendor to haul the Type CC material. The Type CC was not bid on by
either vendor and will not be re-solicited.

The Purchasing Office concurs with Travis County Transportation and
Natural Resources recommendation to award a contract to low bidder,
Industrial Asphalt, LLC.

» Contract-Related Information:
Award Amount: estimated requirements
Contract Type:  annual, unilateral
Contract Period: June 22", 2014 — June 21%, 2015

» Solicitation-Related Information:
Solicitation Viewed: 21 Responses Received: 2
HUB Information: N/A % HUB Subcontractor: N/A

AGENDA REQUEST DEADLINE: All agenda requests and supporting materials must be submitted as a
pdf to agenda@co.travis.tx.us by Tuesdays at 5:00 p.m. for the next week's meeting.




» Funding Information:
[] SAP Shopping Cart #:

X Funding Account(s): budget cost center is 1490200145
[ ] Comments:

AGENDA REQUEST DEADLINE: All agenda requests and supporting materials must be submitted as a
pdf to agenda@co.travis.tx.us by Tuesdays at 5:00 p.m. for the next week's meeting.




Bid #1404-004-RF

Asphaltic Road Materials

GROUP A: MATERIALS

Wheeler - APAC

Industrial Asphalt LLC

Item # Item Qty  Unit |Prod Code Price Total Prod Code Price Total
1404-004-RF--01-01  Material Only Hot Mix Type A - Delivered or FOB Plant to East Zone 500 ton TYPE A $70.00 $35,000.00 ]1.1081 TY A HOTMIX $57.00 $28,500.00
1404-004-RF--01-02  Material Only Hot Mix Type A - Delivered or FOB Plant to West Zone 500 ton TYPE A $70.00 $35,000.00 ]1.1081 TY A HOTMIX $57.00 $28,500.00
1404-004-RF--01-03  Material Only Hot Mix Type C - Delivered or FOB Plant to East Zone 500 ton TYPE C $60.00 $30,000.00 |1.1074 TY C HOTMIX $55.00 $27,500.00
1404-004-RF--01-04  Material Only Hot Mix Type C - Delivered or FOB Plant to West Zone 500 ton TYPE C $60.00 $30,000.00 |1.1074 TY C HOTMIX $55.00 $27,500.00
1404-004-RF--01-05  Material Only Hot Mix Type CC - Limestone Rock Asphalt - Delivered or FOBPlant 500  ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1404-004-RF--01-0€  Material Only Hot Mix Type CC - Limestone Rock Asphalt - Delivered or FOBPlant 500  ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1404-004-RF--01-07  Material Only Hot Mix Type D - Cold Laid - Delivered or FOB Plant to East Zone 500 ton TYPE D Cold Mix $60.00 $30,000.00 |1.1039 TY D COLDMIX  $68.00 $34,000.00
1404-004-RF--01-08  Material Only Hot Mix Type D - Cold Laid - Delivered or FOB Plant to West Zone 500 ton TYPE D Cold Mix $60.00 $30,000.00 |1.1039 TY D COLDMIX  $68.00 $34,000.00
1404-004-RF--01-0S  Material Only Hot Mix Type D - Delivered or FOB Plant to East Zone 500 ton TYPE D $60.00 $30,000.00 |TYPED $55.00 $27,500.00
1404-004-RF--01-1C  Material Only Hot Mix Type D - Delivered or FOB Plant to West Zone 500 ton TYPE D $60.00 $30,000.00 |TYPED $55.00 $27,500.00
1404-004-RF--01-11  Material Only Hot Mix Type D RAP - Delivered or FOB Plant to East Zone 500 ton TYPE D RAP $55.00 $27,500.00 |TYPE D RAP $54.00 $27,000.00
1404-004-RF--01-12  Material Only Hot Mix Type D RAP - Delivered or FOB Plant to West Zone 500 ton TYPE D RAP $55.00 $27,500.00 |TYPE D RAP $54.00 $27,000.00

TOTAL: $610.00 $305,000.00 TOTAL: $578.00 $289,000.00
GROUP B: HAULING CHARGES

Wheeler - APAC Industrial Asphalt LLC

Item # Item Qty Unit  |Prod Code Price Total Prod Code Price Total
1404-004-RF--02-ALL Grid # X: Hauling Charges Per Ton - ALL ASSOCIATED LINE ITEMS 1 ton ALL LINES NOBID  NOBID ALL LINES **97-813  **%§7-$13

TOTAL: NOBID NOBID TOTAL: $3,406.25 $3,406.25

Award is to be made to low bidder, Industrial Aspahalt, on an "all or none basis"

**There are 997 line items in Group B: Hauling Charges. The line items are for hauling
charges to different MAPSCO Grid locations based on the material type. APAC no bid
all hauling charges and the prices quoted by Industrial Asphalt range from $7.00 to
$13.00 per 1 ton, depending on the Grid Location. See Bid Tabulation Packet for all

997 line items.



TRANSPORTATION AND NATURAL RESOURCES
STEVEN M. MANILLA, P.E., COUNTY EXECUTIVE

700 Lavaca St. 5" floor

Travis County Administration Building
P. 0. Box 1748

Austin, Texas 78767

(512) 854-9383

FAX (512) 854-4697

May 14, 2014

MEMORANDUM
TO: Cyd Grimes, County Purchasmg Agent

FROM: Steven ﬁ lla Co ty Executive

SUBJECT: Award of Solicitation 1404-004-RF
Asphaltic Road Materials

TNR has reviewed the above referenced solicitation and recommends award to Industrial Asphalt, LLC., the
lowest responsive bidder.

The product categories for this contract are 30121600 and 76121500. The budgeted cost center is
1490200145.

If you need additional information, please contact April Rodriguez at 854-7676.

AR:SMM:ar



	10882 : Cont. Award IFB 1404-004-RF, Asphaltic Materials
	ExecutiveSummaryPAM 2011
	Excel_Tabulation_for_Bid_1404-004-RF
	Asphaltic Materials 2014 Award Memo




