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7Ny Travis County Commissioners Court Agenda Request

Meeting Date: May 13", 2014

Prepared By/Phone Number: Rachel Fishback, 512.854.9853
Elected/Appointed Official/Dept. Head: Cyd Grimes
Commissioners Court Sponsor: Judge Biscoe

Approve Contract Award for Automotive Storage Batteries, IFB No.
1403-015-RF, to low bidder, Interstate Batteries

» Purchasing Recommendation and Comments: Purchasing concurs
with department and recommends approval of requested action. This
procurement action meets the compliance requirements as outlined by
the statutes.

This contract requires for the vendors to provide Automotive Storage
Batteries to Travis County Transportation and Natural Resources.

On April 7", 2014, IFB No. 1403-015-RF was issued through BidSync.
Five (5) bids were received on April 28", 2014. The Purchasing Office
concurs with Travis County Transportation and Natural Resources
recommendation to award a contract to low bidder, Interstate Batteries.

» Contract-Related Information:
Award Amount: estimated requirement
Contract Type: Annual, Unilateral
Contract Period: May 15, 2014 through May 14, 2015

» Solicitation-Related Information:
Solicitations Viewed: 31 Responses Received: 5
HUB Information: N/A % HUB Subcontractor: N/A

AGENDA REQUEST DEADLINE: All agenda requests and supporting materials must be submitted as a
pdf to agenda@co.travis.tx.us by Tuesdays at 5:00 p.m. for the next week's meeting.




» Funding Information:
[] SAP Shopping Cart #:

[] Funding Account(s):
X Comments: Requisitions are processed at time of requirement

AGENDA REQUEST DEADLINE: All agenda requests and supporting materials must be submitted as a
pdf to agenda@co.travis.tx.us by Tuesdays at 5:00 p.m. for the next week's meeting.




TABULATION REPORT
Bid #1403-015-RF
AUTOMOTIVE STORAGE BATTERIES

INTERSTATE BATTERIES OReilly Auto Parts Batteries Plus #142 continental battery co General Parts International
Item# Item Qty Unit |Price Total Product No. Price Total Product No. Price Total Product No. |Price Total Product No. Price Total Product No.|
01-01 Battery 12V Group 24 CCA 600 CA 725 6 each [$59.72  $358.32 MT-24 $75.42 $452.52 SuperStart 24-72 $53.34  $320.04 SLI24 $63.95 $383.70 24CS $65.09  $390.54 24-60
01-02 Battery 12V Group 24F CCA 600 CA 725 6 each [$59.72  $358.32 MT-24F $78.48 $470.88 SuperStart 24R72 $53.34  $320.04 SLI24F $63.95 $383.70 24F-CS $65.09  $390.54 24F60
01-03 Battery 12V Group 24 HD CCA 800 CA 875 30 each |$71.24 $2,137.20 MTP-24 $83.70 $2,511.00 SuperStart 24EXT $68.05  $2,041.50 SLI24MHP $63.95 $1,918.50 24CS $69.99  $2,099.70 24-70
01-04 Battery 12V Group 24F HD CCA 800 CA 875 6 each |$70.52 $423.12 MTP-24F $84.16 $504.96 SuperStart 24REXT No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.95 $383.70 24F-CS $69.99 $419.94 24F70
01-05 Battery 12V Group 27 CCA 675 CA 800 6 each |$71.24 $427.44 MT-27 $82.97 $497.82 SuperStart 27-72 $63.81  $382.86 SLI27 $67.45 $404.70 27CS $69.99 $419.94 27-70
01-06 Battery 12V Group 27 HD CCA 700 CA 850 5 each |$71.24  $356.20 MTP-27 $82.97 $414.85 SuperStart 27-72 $79.93  $399.65 SLI27M $67.45 $337.25 27CS $69.99  $349.95 27-70
01-07 Battery 12V Group 30H CCA 650 CA 825 6 each |$67.64  $405.84 29H-VHD $86.45 $518.70 SuperStart 30H2 $63.58  $381.48 SLI3OH $67.95 $407.70 30H $82.59  $495.54 30H24
01-08 Battery 12V Group 31P CCA 950 CA 1100 35 each |$80.59 $2,820.65 31P-MHD $90.00 $3,150.00 SuperStart 31-5 $67.11  $2,348.85 SLI31PA $69.95 $2,448.25 XHD31A $88.19  $3,086.65 31XP30
01-09 Battery 12V Group 31S CCA 650 CA 825 70 each |$66.92  $4,684.40 31-VHD $81.72 $5,720.40 SuperStart 31-4T $67.11  $4,697.70 SLI31SA $61.95 $4,336.50 HD31C $64.39  $4,507.30 31XS24
01-10 Battery 12V DC Group 34 CCA 800 CA 1000 5 each [$66.92 $334.60 MTP-34 $199.49  $997.45 Optima RED34/78 $64.73  $323.65 SLI34M $119.04  $595.20 OPT34-RT $108.49 $542.45 NG34
01-11 Battery 12V DC Class 34R CCA 800 CA 1000 5 each |$72.28 $361.40 MTP-34R $204.24  $1,021.20 Optima RED34R $64.73  $323.65 SLI34RM $119.04  $595.20 OPT34R-RT $101.49 $507.45 NG34R
01-12  Battery 12V Group 34 CCA 700 CA 875 6 each |$61.87 $371.22 MT-34 $76.07 $456.42 SuperStart 34-72 $64.73  $388.38 SLI34M $63.95 $383.70 34CP $75.59  $453.54 34-70
01-13  Battery 12V Group 48 CCA 730 CA 915 75 each |$81.32  $6,099.00 MTP-48/H6 $136.80 $10,260.00 SuperStart 48PLT $76.88  $5,766.00 SLI48H6M $79.95 $5,996.25 L3/H6/48CP $98.69  $7,401.75 48-70
01-14 Battery 12V Group 51 CCA 450 CA 540 12 each |$54.28 $651.36 I-51 $77.49 $929.88 SuperStart 51-72 $44.02  $528.24 SLI51 No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.29  $915.48 51-60
01-15 Battery 12V Group 51R CCA 450 CA 540 12 each |$54.28 $651.36 I-51R $74.61 $895.32 SuperStart 51R72 $44.02  $528.24 SLIS1R $51.55 $618.60 51CS $69.99  $839.88 51R60
01-16 Battery 12V Group 58 CCA 540 CA 635 30 each |$58.28  $1,748.40 MT-58 $74.19 $2,225.70 SuperStart 58-72 $48.51  $1,455.30 SLIS8 $51.55 $1,546.50 58-CS $69.99  $2,099.70 58-60
01-17 Battery 12V Group 58R CCA 580 CA 700 15 each [$58.28 $874.20 MT-58R $76.33 $1,144.95 SuperStart 58R72 $48.51  $727.65 SLIS8R $53.55 $803.25 58R-CS $69.99  $1,049.85 58R42-60
01-18 Battery 12V Group 65 CCA 850 CA 950 75 each |$78.44  $5,883.00 MTP-65 $93.39 $7,004.25 SuperStart 65EXT $67.24  $5,043.00 SLI65SM $69.99 $5,249.25 65CP $95.89  $7,191.75 AG6584N
01-19 Battery 12V DC Group 34/78 CCA 800 CA 1000 5 each |$77.00 $385.00 MTP-78DT $101.04  $505.20 SuperStart 34/78PRM  [$66.32  $331.60 SLI34-DTM $119.04  $595.20 OPT34/78RT $114.09 $570.45 NG34/78
01-20 Battery 12V DC Group 78 CCA 800 CA 1000 30 each |$74.12  $2,223.60 MTP-78 $85.40 $2,562.00 SuperStart 78EXT $59.60  $1,788.00 SLI78M $64.75 $1,942.50 78CP $93.79  $2,813.70 79-70
01-21 Battery 12V Group78 Side Post CCA 700 CA 850 30 each |$64.76 $1,942.80 MT-78 $75.17 $2,255.10 SuperStart 78-72 $59.60  $1,788.00 SLI78M $64.75 $1,942.50 78CP $75.59  $2,267.70 78-60
01-22 Battery 12V Group 94R/H7 CCA 780 CA 980 20 each |$94.26  $1,885.20 MTP-94R/H7 $125.62  $2,512.40 SuperStart 94REXT $108.99 $2,179.80 SLIS4RH7M $94.95 $1,899.00 LS/H7/94R-CP  |$119.69 $2,393.80 94R70
01-23  Battery 12V Group 4D CCA 1000 CA 1250 6 each |$111.56 $669.36 4D-XHD $141.26  $847.56 SuperStart 4D3 $108.56 $651.36 SLI4DA $105.34  $632.04 4 $130.19 $781.14 4D30
01-24 Battery 12V Group 4DLT CCA 820 CA 1005 10 each [$92.12 $921.20 4DLT-VHD $121.38  $1,213.80 SuperStart 4DLT $100.82 $1,008.20 SLI4ADLT $96.95 $969.50 4DLT $122.49 $1,224.90 4DLT30
01-25 Battery 12V Group U1 CCA 300 CA 375 15 each [|$34.95 $524.25 SP-35 $44.46 $666.90 SuperStart UILUH $29.02  $435.30 SLIU1HP $28.95 $434.25 U1-300 $32.89  $493.35 UiL12
01-26 Battery 12V Class 24MS-HD CCA 500 CA 625 5 each |$57.72 $288.60 24M-HD $59.85 $299.25 SuperStart CAPTAIN $57.75  $288.75 SLI24MDP $49.90 $249.50 M24-60 $79.09  $395.45 DCG24
01-27 Battery 12V Group 27M-DC CCA 800 CA 1000 5 each |$75.96 $379.80 27M-XHD $81.22 $406.10 SuperStart 27MS No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.95 $334.75 M24-1000 $97.09  $485.45 DCG27
01-28 Battery 12V Group 34/78DT CCA 750 CA 850 25 each |$77.00 $1,925.00 MTP-78DT $101.04  $2,526.00 SuperStart 34/78PRM  [$66.32  $1,658.00 SLI34DTM $67.80 $1,695.00 34/78CP $86.09  $2,152.25 AG3478-84
01-29 Battery Core Charge 50 each |$0.00 $0.00 CORE $15.00 $750.00 Core $12.00 $600.00 SLI CORE $15.00 $750.00 core charge No Bid No Bid No Bid
01-30 Texas User Fee 1 each |$3.00 $3.00 EXCISE FEE $3.00 $3.00 Fee $3.00 $3.00 ENV300 $3.00 $3.00 texas battery fee|[No Bid  No Bid No Bid
TOTAL: $40,093.84 $53,723.61 $36,708.24 $38,239.19 $46,740.14

INTERSTATE BATTERIES $40,093.84

BATTERIES PLUS #142 $36,708.24 **Bidder is deemed non-responsive: bidder did not bid on 2 line items

CONTINENTAL BATTERY CO $38,239.19 **Bidder is deemed non-responsive: bidder did not bid on 1 line item

GENERAL PARTS INTERNATIONAL $46,740.14

OREILLY AUTO PARTS

$53,723.61




TRANSPORTATION AND NATURAL RESOURCES
STEVEN M. MANILLA, P.E., County Executive

700 Lavaca St 5" Floor

Travis County Administration Building
P. O. Box 1748

Austin, Texas 78767

(512) 854-9383

FAX (512) 854-4697

April 30, 2014

MEMORANDUM

TO: Cyd Grimes, County Purchasing Agent
gAlip | (D C A

FROM: Steven M. Manil .E., County Executive

SUBJECT: Award of Bid, 1403-015-RF, Automotive Storage Batteries

TNR has reviewed the above referenced bids and recommends award to Interstate Batteries, the overall low
responsive bidder.

The product category for Auto and Truck Maintenance Items is 25173900. The budgeted cost centers are
1490350001 and 1490350145.

If you need additional information, please contact April Rodriguez at 854-7676.

AR:SMM:ar
Contract File
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